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RE: Tribal Notification to Request Advice and Comments Letter 19-17

8.321.2 NMAC Specialized Behavioral Health Services 

Dear Tribal Leadership, Indian Health Service, Tribal Health Providers and other interested parties: 

Seeking advice and comments from New Mexico's Indian Nations, Tribes, Pueblos and their 
healthcare providers is an important component of the government-to-government relationship with the 
State of New Mexico. In accordance with the New Mexico Human Services Department's (HSD's) 
Tribal Notification to Request Advice and Comments process, this letter is to inform you that HSD, 
through the Medical Assistance Division (MAD), is accepting comments until 5:00 p.m. Mountain 

Time (MT) through October 16, 2019, regarding replacing Specialized Behavioral Health
Services rule (8.321.2) of the New Mexico Administrative Code (NMAC). 

MAD is proposing some new services, as well as changes to some existing services. The rule was also 
reviewed for currency and clarity with changes being made as necessary. Language was also added 
throughout the rnle to direct individuals to the Behavioral Health (BH) Policy and Billing Manual for 
additional information. 

Estimated Total Financial Impact 

The financial impact for the new services described in this proposed rule, is estimated to be 
$34,000,000, annually, in combined federal and state funds. The primary fiscal impact is related to new 
services that are being added as part of the Department's 1115 waiver renewal for the Centennial Care 
program. 

The Department determined that it is appropriate to repeal and replace previous rule because of the 
number of changes. Section 9-8-6 NMSA 1978, authorizes the Department Secretary to promulgate 
rules and regulations that may be necessary to carry out the duties of the Department and its divisions. 
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objectives outlined in the treatment plan; and 3) ensuring proper and adequate supervision is provided 
at all times. Treatment teams detennine that all out-of-home activities are appropriate for the 
recipient's level of need, including the need for supervision. The treatment foster care agency provides 
intensive support, technical assistance, and supervision of all treatment foster parents. The following 
services must be furnished by both TFC I or II agencies unless specified for either I or II: a) provision 
of individual, family or group psychotherapy to recipients as described in the treatment plan. The TFC 
therapist is an active treatment team member and paiiicipates fully in the treatment planning process; 
b) family therapy is required when client reunification with their family is the goal; c) providing crisis 
intervention on call to treatment foster parents, recipient's and their families on a 24-hour, seven days a 
week basis including 24-hour availability of appropriate staff to respond to the home in crisis 
situations; d) assessing the family's strengths, needs and developing a family service plan when an 
eligible recipient's return to his or her family is planned; e) conducting a private face-to-face visit with 
the eligible recipient within the first two weeks of TFC I placement and at least twice monthly 
thereafter by the treatment coordinator; f) conducting a face-to-face interview with the eligible 
recipient's TFC parents within the first two weeks of TFC I placement and at least twice monthly 
thereafter by the treatment coordinator; g) conducting at a minimum one phone contact with the TFC I 
parents weekly; phone contact is not necessary in the same week as the face-to-face contact by the 
treatment coordinator; h) conducting a private face-to-face interview with the eligible recipient's TFC 
II parent within the first two weeks of TFC II placement and at least once monthly thereafter by the 
treatment coordinator; i) conducting a face-to-face interview with the eligible recipient's TFC II parent 
within the first two weeks of TFC II placement and at least once monthly thereafter by the treatment 
coordinator; and j) conducting at a minimum, one phone contact with the TFC II parents weekly by the 
treatment coordinator; phone contact is not necessary in the same week as the face-to-face contact.

Subsection E: Proposes to update the dual reimbursement for TFC and CCSS to allow CCSS 
to be reimbursed while transitional planning from one level to the next, or to family or community is 
occurring: CCSS as part of the discharge planning from either the eligible recipient's TFC I or II 
placement. 

Tribal Impact: HSD does not anticipate a negative service or financial impact to Native Americans, 

Pueblos, Indian Health Services or Tribal healthcare providers. 

Tribal Advice and Comments 

Tribes and health care providers may view the proposed 8.321.2 NMAC, on the HSD webpage at:  
http://www.hsd.state.nm.us/providers/wri tten-tribal-consultations.aspx, Notification Letter 19-17.

A written copy of these documents may be requested by contacting the HSD Medical Assistance 
Division (HSD/MAD) in Santa Fe at (505) 827-6252. 

Important Dates 

A public hearing on this rule is scheduled be held in the Rio Grande Conference Room, Toney 

Anaya Building, 2550 Cerrillos Road, Santa Fe, NM on Wednesday, October 16, 2019 at 9:00 a.m.
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Mountain Time (MT). 

Written advice and comments must be received no later than 5:00 p.m. Mountain Time {MT) Q.!! 
Wednesday, October 16, 2019. Please send your advice, comments or questions to the MAD Native 
American Liaison, Theresa Belanger, at (505) 827-3122 or by email to Theresa.Belanger@state.nm.us. 

All comments and responses will be compiled and made available after November 4, 2019. 

cc: Kari Armijo, HSD/MAD Deputy Director 
Theresa Belanger, Native American Liaison, HSD/MAD 
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